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POWER OF ATTORNEY

Which gives all powers to Branko Maric attorney at law from Sarajevo,
Mehmeda Spahe 24, or Edina Kasumagi6 acting in the name of Vanity
International Corporation, No. 35 New Road, P.O. Box 1708 Belize City,
Belize, CA as the founder of PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo sa
ogranicenom odgovornos6u za nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo:

to sign the Agreement on Changing of the Agreement on Founding by
which the Company PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo sa
ogranicenom odgovornoscu za nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo changes
the seat and the director;

to sign the Decision on Changing of the Statute of the Company;

to file requests to the Ministry of Foreign Commerce and Economic
Relations of BiH and Municipal Court in Sarajevo;

to represent our company in the procedure by Ministry of Foreign
Commerce and Economic Relations of BiH and Municipal Court in
Sarajevo;

to receive all documents issued by the Ministry and by the Court.

In Belize on January 14, 2008

Issuer:



POWER OF ATTORNEY

Which gives all powers to Branko Maric attorney at law from Sarajevo,
Mehmeda Spahe 24, or Edina Kasumagic acting in the name of Vanity
International Corporation, No. 35 New Road, PO Box 1708 Belize City,
Belize, CA as the founder of PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo sa
ogranicenom odgovornoscu za nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo

to sign the Statute of the company PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo
sa ogranicenom odgovornoscu za nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo
to sign all the documents regarding change of business name of the
founder DELTA M d.o.o. Belgrade.

Belize, October, 10th 2007

Vanity International Corporation



POWER OF ADORNEY

Which gives all powers to Branko Maric attorney at law from Sarajevo,
Mehmeda Spahe 24, or Edina Kasurnagic acting in the name of Vanity
International Corporation, No. 35 New Road, PO Box 1708 Belize City,
Belize, CA as the founder of PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo sa
ogranicenorn odgovornoscu za nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo:

to sign the Contract no 1/2007 on foundation of the company
PREZIDENT NEKRETNINE drustvo sa ogranicenom odgovornoscu za
nekretnine i trgovinu Sarajevo;

to file requests to the Ministry of Foreign Commerce and Economic
Relations of BiH and Municipal Court in Sarajevo;

to represent our company in the procedure of the registration of the
new company by Ministry of Foreign Commerce and Economic
Relations of BiH and Municipal Court in Sarajevo;

to receive all documents issued by the Ministry of Foreign Commerce
and Economic Relations of BiH and by the Municipal court

In on 2007

Issuer:
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